SUMMARY SHEET Date: 9/1/2016 @ 2:00

N\ \\,\ _C,Q,v

County of McHenry Purchasing Dept  Bid/RFP: BID 16-72 Residential Waste Hauling

Vendor FADFVAN:ClED DISPOSAL
City / State . ‘Waukegan IL
ORGINAL SIGNATURE iiyes Ui
MANDATORY PAGES T e
— Year 1 Yearl Year 2 Year2 Year 3 Year 3
January 1,2017 - | Senior Discoun]: January 1, 2018 - | Senior Discount { January 1,2019 - | Senior Discoun_t
December 31, 2017 Q“‘a‘;‘:ﬂzﬁg ) December 31, 2018 Q“i;fff?i?i; U] December 31,2019 Q“Z::gza;‘;:; @t
95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $94.80 $94.80 $97.64 $97.64 | $100.57 | $100.57
65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter™ $95.80 | $95.80 | $98.67 | $98.67 | $101.63 | $101.63
35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter™ $96.80 | $96.80 | $99.70 | $99.70 | $102.70 | $102.70
By the Bag Option:
Cost per bag no bid no bid 10 bid no bid no bid no bid
- Quarterly cost for core program services™ no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
TOTAL $287.40 | $287.40 | S$574.80 | $296.01 | $304.90 | $600.91

Recycling toter approx. size
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY)

95 oallon (w1th weeklv or every other week collecuon)

OR 65 callon (w1th weekly collectmn)

65 gallon/weekly

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS
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SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 9/1/2016 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: BID 16-72 Residential Waste Hauling

95 callon (w1th weekly or every other week collection)

Vendor . ‘ GROOT
City / State Elk Grove Vsllage IL ”
ORGINAL SIGNATURE U yes e
MANDATORY PAGES T I R
Year 1 Year1l Year2 Year 2 Year3 Year 3
January 1,2017 - | Senior Discount | January 1,2018 - | Senior Discount { January 1,2019 - | Senior Discount
December 31, 2017 Qu?;:gza;?:; (i December 31, 2018 Qu:;t{;g;;:; (it December 31, 2019 QU::;:;;CI’:; (if
95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter® $59.49 N/A $62.16 N/A $64.95 N/A
65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter™ §57.51 N/A $60.15 N/A $62.88 N/A
35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $55.50 $52.71 $58.14 $55.23 $60.78 $57.74
By the Bag Option:
Cost per bag $3.20 N/A $3.30 N/A $3.40 N/A
Quarterly cost for core program services™ $29.40 N/A $30.58 N/A $31.80 N/A
TOTAL $205.10 $52.71 $214.33 $55.23 $223.81 $57.74
Recycling toter approx. size
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY) OR.

65 oallon (w1th weekly co}]ecnon)

95 gallon/every other week -

Sent to 33 potential bidders. Submittals received from 5.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS
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SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept  Bid/RFP: BID 16-72 Residential Waste Hauling

Date: 9/1/2016 @ 2:00

Vendor

City / State -

LAkEﬁfplstsAL. S

ORGINAL SIGNATURE

_ Grayslake IL .|

iyes o

MANDATORY PAGES

Year 1 Year1 Year2 Year2 Year3 Year 3
January 1,2017 - | Senior Discount | January 1.2018 - | Senior Discount | January 1, 2019 - | Senior Discount
December 31, 2017 December 31, 2018 December 31, 2019

95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter™ $57.45 N/A $59.76 N/A $62.16 N/A

65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter® $55.35 $51.75 $57.57 $53.82 $59.88 $55.97

35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $52.65 $51.75 $54.75 $53.82 $56.94 $55.97

By the Bag Option: |

Cost per bag $3.00 N/A - $3.15 N/A $3.30 N/A

Quarterly cost for core program services* $27.00 N/A $28.10 N/A $29.25 N/A
~—TOTAL $195.45 $103.50 $203.33 $107.64 $211.53 $111.94

Recycling toter approx. size

(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)

(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY) OR

95 gallon (with weekly or every other week collection)

65 gallon (with weekly collection)

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

S 95 gallon/weekly

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 9/1/2016 @ 2:00
Bid/RFP: BID 16-72 Residential Waste Hauling

A;G)x:/

S

Vﬁndof PRAIRIELAND
City / State v : Lake Bamngton L
ORGINAL SIGNATURE TR P
MANDATORY PAGES
Year 1 Year1l Year2 Year 2 Year 3 Year 3
January 1, 2017 - | Senior Discount {| January 1, 2018 - Senior Discount | January 1,2019 - | Senior Discount
December 31, 2017 | QUaTEAY SOSLGEL 1y ber 31, 2018 | QUAMETY COSLGEL 1y er 31, 2019 | Quaterly cost (if
i applicable) applicable) applicable)
95 gallon (approx. size) refuse foter™ $57.72 $57.72 $59.45 $59.45 $61.23 $61.23
65 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter™ $54.72 $54.72 $56.36 $56.36 $58.05 $58.05
35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter” §51.72 | $49.13 | $53.27 | $50.60 | $54.87 | $52.12
By the Bag Option:
Cost per bag $3.10 $3.10 $3.20 $3.20 $3.30 $3.30
Quarterly cost for core program services* $22.65 $22.65 $23.33 $23.33 $24.03 $24.03
TOTAL $189.91 | $187.32 | $195.61 | $192.94 | $201.48 | $198.73
Recycling toter approx. size
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY) 95 oallon (thh week]y or every other week collection) OR 65 oallon (vmh weekly collectlon)
i R X L. 93 oallon/weekly ...... Pyl . H : L

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




SUMMARY SHEET
County of McHenry Purchasing Dept

Date: 9/1/2016 @ 2:00

Bid/RFP: BID 16-72 Residential Waste Hauling

Vendor WASTE MANAGEMENT
City / State McHenry IL
ORGINAL SIGNATURE . iyes
MANDATORY PAGES Ciyes.
Year1l Year1 Year 2 Year 2 Year 3 Year3
January 1,2017 - | Senior Discount | January 1, 2018 - { Senior Discount | January 1,2019 - | Senior Discount

December 31,2017 Qu:;t:;’ilza;t;:; Gt December 31, 2018 Q“:;t:lrilr);/a;‘l):; f December 31, 2019 Quz‘;::;za;?:; (if
95 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $59.10 $59.10 $60.87 $60.87 $62.70 $62.70
63 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter* $56.70 $56.70 $58.40 $58.40 $60.15 $60.15
35 gallon (approx. size) refuse toter™ $54.30 | $51.59 | $5593 | $53.13 | $57.61 | $54.73
By the Bag Option:
Cost per bag $3.25 $3.25 $3.35 $3.35 $3.45 $3.45
Quarterly cost for core program services™ $30.00 $30.00 $30.90 $30.90 $31.83 $31.83
TOTAL $203.35 $200.64 $209.45 $206.65 $215.74 $212.86
Recycling toter approx. size
(CIRCLE TOTER SIZE)
(IDENTIFY COLLECTION FREQUENCY) OR

95 gallon (wnh weekly or every other week collection)

95 gallon/every other week

65 callon (w11:h weeL}y collectlon)

Sent to 35 potential bidders. Submittals received from 3.

UNOFFICIAL RESULTS




